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Imagine finding a lost necklace, a beautiful piece of jewelry that seems to
hold a mysterious power. What would you do with it? Would you keep it for
yourself, or would you try to find its rightful owner? In Carla Kelly's new
novel, The Necklace, a young woman named Anya finds herself in just
such a predicament.

Anya is a struggling artist living in New York City. She's always dreamed of
having her own art gallery, but she can't seem to catch a break. One day,
while walking through Central Park, she stumbles upon a lost necklace. It's
a beautiful piece of jewelry, with a large emerald pendant. Anya knows that
it must be worth a lot of money, but she can't bring herself to sell it. There's
something about the necklace that draws her to it, and she feels like it
belongs to her.

Anya starts wearing the necklace everywhere she goes. She finds that it
gives her confidence and makes her feel more beautiful. But soon, she
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starts to notice strange things happening around her. She has vivid dreams
about a woman who seems to be searching for the necklace. And she
starts to see the same woman in her waking life, always watching her from
a distance.

Anya is determined to find out the truth about the necklace. She starts to
investigate its history, and she soon learns that it's not just a piece of
jewelry. It's a magical artifact with a long and storied past. The necklace
has been lost for centuries, and many people have searched for it, but no
one has ever been able to find it. Until now.

Anya soon realizes that she's not the only one who's interested in the
necklace. There are other people who want it for their own evil purposes.
Anya must race against time to find out the truth about the necklace and
protect it from falling into the wrong hands.

The Necklace is a thrilling and suspenseful adventure story that will keep
you on the edge of your seat from beginning to end. Carla Kelly has crafted
a captivating tale that explores the power of magic and the importance of
following your dreams. This is a must-read for fans of historical fiction,
adventure stories, and paranormal romance.

About the Author

Carla Kelly is a New York Times bestselling author of historical fiction and
paranormal romance. She has written over 20 novels, including the popular
"Timeless" series. Carla lives in New York City with her husband and two
children.
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Poignant Story Inspired By True Events For
Anyone Who Has Ever Loved And Lost
In the aftermath of a tragic accident, a young woman is left to pick up the
pieces of her shattered life. But as she begins to heal, she...
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